Item Coversheet , Page 1 of 2

AGENDA MEMORANDUN
TOWN OF NORTH HEMPSTEAD

TO: Supervisor Judi Bosworth

FROM: PETER M. HODA - COMMISSIONER OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES.
TODAY'S DATE:  11/2/2015

MEETING DATE:  11/17/2015

SUBJECT: 14 - Guard Rails & Channel Posts TNH051-2015

It is respectfully requested that a resolution be placed on the Town Board Agenda to award bid TNH051-2015-Guard Rails & Channel
Posts to be used Town wide.

TYPE: Services Agreement

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE AWARD OF A BID FOR GUARD RAILS & CHANNEL POSTS (TNH051-2015).

General Ledger Account Code:

Contract Amount: Contract Term:
1 YEAR

Option to Extend: Option Description:

False

ATTACHMENTS:

File Name Description

n TNH051-2015- Guard Rails and Channel Posts-Recap.pdf TNH051-2015-Guard Rails & Channel Posts-Recap
4] TNH051-2015- Guard Rails and Channel Posts-Award.pdf TNHO51-2015-Guard Rails & Channel Posts-Award

o INH051-2015- Guard_Rails and Channel Posts-Copy of Response (1)-
garden_State Hwy Products.pdf

o TNH051-2015- Guard Ralls and Channel Posts-Copy of Response (2)-
Chemung_Supply.pdf

o TNH051-2015- Guard Rails and Channel Posts-Copy of Response (3)-
Residential Fences.pdf

o TNH051-2015- Guard_Rails_and Channel Posts-Copy of Response (4)-
Landtek Group.pdf TNHO091-2015- Guard Ralls &

TNHO051-2015-Guard Rails & Channel Posts-Copy of Response (1) Garden State Hwy

TNHO51-2015- Guard Raiis and Channel Posts-Copy of Response {2)-Chemung Supply

TNH051-2015- Guard Raiis and Channel Posts-Copy of Response (3)-Residential Fences

0O Trafio S—a—ﬁ;t— o " TNHE51-2015- Guard Ralls and Channel Posts-Copy of Response (5)-Traffic Safety
o INH051-2015- Guard Rails and Channel Posts-Copy of Response (6)- TNHO51-2015- Guard Rails and Channel Posts-Copy of Response (6)-Vulcar Signs-No
Vulcan Signs-No_Response.pdf Response

Supervisor Bosworth offered the following resolution and moved its adoption, which resolution was declared adopted after a poll of the
members of this Board:

RESOLUTION NO,. 739-2015
A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE AWARD OF A BID FOR GUARD RAILS & CHANNEL POSTS (TNH051-2015).

WHEREAS, the Commissioner of Administrative Services (the “Commissioner”) solicited bids for guard rails and channel posts and bids
were received as forth in Exhibit A attached hereto (the “Bids”); and
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WHEREAS, following a review of the Bids, the Commissioner has recommended an award as set forth in Exhibit B attached hereto (the
“Award”); and

WHEREAS, this Board wishes to authorize the Award as recommended by the Commissioner.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT

RESOLVED that the Award as recommended by the Commissioner is hereby authorized; and be it further

RESOLVED that the Supervisor and/or the Commissioner of Administrative Services be and hereby is authorized and directed to execute, on
behalf of the Town, any purchase agreements and related documents, a copy of which shall be on file in the Department of Administrative Services,

and to take such other related action as may be necessary to effectuate the foregoing; and be it further

RESOLVED that the Comptroller be, and hereby is, authorized and directed to pay the costs of said awards upon receipt of a duly executed
and certified claims therefor.

Dated: Manhasset, New York
November 17, 2015

The vote on the foregoing resolution was recorded as recorded as follows:

Ayes: Councilwoman De Giorgio, Councilwoman Kaplan,
Councitwoman Russell, Councilwoman Seeman,
Councilnian Zuckerman, Supervisor Bosworth

Nays: None

cc:  Town Attorney Comptroller ~Administrative Services
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TNHO051-2015- Guard Rails and Channel Posts

Garden State Highway Products,

Chemung Supply Corp.

Residential Fences Corp.

The Landtekgroup Inc.

Traffic Safety Service

1740 E. Oak Road

PO Box 527

1775 Route 25

235 County Line Rd.

601 Hadley Road

Vineland, NJ 08361

Elmira, NY 14902

Ridge, NY 11961

Amityville, NY 11701

South Plainfield, NJ 07080

Bid valid for one year from date of award.

856-692-7572

607-733-5506

631-924-3011

631-691-2381

908-561-4800

856-692-6797

607-732-5379

631-924-3275

631-598-8280

908-561-3800

Sharon Green

Carl Perrine

John Gulino

Nichael Ryan

John Sandy

sharon@gardenstatehwy.com

cperine@chemungsupply.com

johng@rfcfence.com |

estimating@landtekgroup.com

info@trafficsafetyservice.com

ltems Price Price Price Price Price

1} |12' - 6" GALVANIZED W BEAM RAIL SECTIONS EQUAL

TO BUFFALO SPECIALTY, NEW HARDWARE ONLY. No Bid | $ 68.40 [ $ 9255 (% 89.00 | $ 91.44
2} |5'- 6" GALVANIZED | BEAM POSTS FOR GUARD RAIL

EQUAL TO BUFFALO SPECIALTY ,NEW HARDWARE ONLY No Bid | $ 4284 1% 48.60 | $ 4950 | $ 61.60
3} |GUARD RAIL ENDS ( FULL WRAP ) EQUAL TO BUFFALO

SPECIALTY , NEW HARDWARE ONLY No Bid | $ 38.60 [ $ 43.00 | $ 44.00 | $ 41.07
4} |GUARD RAIL ENDS, (FLARED) EQUAL TO BUFFALO

SPECIALTY, NEW HARDWARE ONLY. No Bid | $ 3420 $ 43.00 | $ 41.75( $ 32.67
5} |11/4" X 5/8" GUARD RAIL BOLTS No Bid | $ 0401($ 095]$ 1.00|$ 0.61
6} |2" X 5/8" GUARD RAIL BOLTS No Bid | $ 0401($ 1.05|$% 1.00|$ 0.71
7} |5/8 " GUARD RAIL NUTS No Bid | $ 040 $ 010]$ 010]$ 0.65
8} |5/8 " GUARD RAIL WASHERS NoBid | $ 040 $ 0.10]$ 1.00|$ 0.47
9} |12' X 2 7/8" O.D. GALVANIZED PIPE, 110 WALL THICKNESS $ 4958 | $ 3965($ 33.00 | $ 4850 | $ 50.40
10}|10 ' RIBBED BACK FLANGED STEEL CHANNEL POSTS,

3/8" DIAMETER HOLES ON 1" CENTERS, PAINTED

DARK GREEN, 2 POUNDS PER FOOT. $ 16.78 | $ 1294 | $ 1935 $ 2475 | $ 18.29
11}|12 ' RIBBED BACK FLANGED STEEL CHANNEL POSTS 3/8"

DIAMETER , HOLES ON 1 " CENTERS, PAINTED DARK

GREEN, 2 POUNDS PER FOOT. $ 18.94  $ 1544 | $ 23.25($% 28.25 (% 21.94
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TNHO051-2015- Guard Rails and Channel Posts

Garden State Highway Products,

Chemung Supply Corp.

Residential Fences Corp.

The Landtekgroup Inc.

Traffic Safety Service

1740 E. Oak Road

PO Box 527

1775 Route 25

235 County Line Rd.

601 Hadley Road

Vineland, NJ 08361

Elmira, NY 14902

Ridge, NY 11961

Amityville, NY 11701

South Plainfield, NJ 07080

Bid valid for one year from date of award.

856-692-7572

607-733-5506

631-924-3011

631-691-2381

908-561-4800

856-692-6797

607-732-5379

631-924-3275

631-598-8280

908-561-3800

Sharon Green

Carl Perrine

John Gulino

Nichael Ryan

John Sandy

sharon@gardenstatehwy.com

cperine@chemungsupply.com

johng@rfcfence.com |

estimating@landtekgroup.com

info@trafficsafetyservice.com

10 ' GALVANIZED CHANNEL POSTS,

3/8" DIAMETER HOLES ON 1" CENTERS

2 POUNDS PER FOOT $ 19.98 | $ 16.94 | $ 29.05 | $ 2825 | $

12" GALVANIZED CHANNEL POSTS 3/8"

DIAMETER , HOLES ON 1" CENTERS

2 POUNDS PER FOOT $ 2407 | $ 20.16 | $ 34.58 | $ 3375 | $
) |Schedule 40 Pipe 2-3/8" x 5’ $ 3126 | $ 2420 [ $ 12.90 [ $ 1575 | $
) |[King Blocks No Bid | $ 1094 | $ $ 1125 $
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TNHO051-2015- Guard Rails and Channel Posts

Winning Vendor

Items Won

Chemung Supply Corp.

1,2,3,5,6,10,11,12

PO Box 527

Elmira, NY 14902

607-733-5506

607-732-5379

Carl Perrine

cperine@chemungsupply.com

Residential Fences Corp.

7,8,9,14,15

1775 Route 25

Ridge, NY 11961

631-924-3011

631-924-3275

John Gulino

johng@rfcfence.com

The Landtekgroup Inc.

235 County Line Rd.

Amityville, NY 11701

631-691-2381

631-598-8280

Nichael Ryan

estimating@landtekgroup.com

Traffic Safety Service

4,13

601 Hadley Road

South Plainfield, NJ 07080

908-561-4800

908-561-3800

John Sandy

info@trafficsafetyservice.com



mailto:cperine@chemungsupply.com
mailto:johng@rfcfence.com
mailto:estimating@landtekgroup.com
mailto:info@trafficsafetyservice.com

	TNH051-2015- Guard Rails- Award Reso- 739-2015- dated 11-17-2015
	TNH051-2015- Guard Rails and Channel Posts-Recap
	Sheet1

	TNH051-2015- Guard Rails and Channel Posts-Award
	Sheet1


