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TNH051-2015- Guard Rails and Channel Posts  Garden State Highway Products, Chemung Supply Corp. Residential Fences Corp. The Landtekgroup Inc. Traffic Safety Service

1740 E. Oak Road PO Box 527 1775 Route 25 235 County Line Rd. 601 Hadley Road
Vineland, NJ 08361 Elmira, NY 14902 Ridge, NY 11961 Amityville, NY 11701 South Plainfield, NJ 07080

Bid valid for one year from date of award. 856-692-7572 607-733-5506 631-924-3011 631-691-2381 908-561-4800
856-692-6797 607-732-5379 631-924-3275 631-598-8280 908-561-3800
Sharon Green Carl Perrine John Gulino Nichael Ryan John Sandy
sharon@gardenstatehwy.com cperine@chemungsupply.com johng@rfcfence.com estimating@landtekgroup.com info@trafficsafetyservice.com

 Items Price Price Price Price Price

1} 12' - 6" GALVANIZED W BEAM RAIL SECTIONS EQUAL
TO BUFFALO SPECIALTY, NEW HARDWARE ONLY. No Bid 68.40$                                                 92.55$                                  89.00$                                                      91.44$                                                      

2} 5' - 6" GALVANIZED I BEAM POSTS FOR GUARD RAIL
EQUAL TO BUFFALO SPECIALTY ,NEW HARDWARE ONLY No Bid 42.84$                                                 48.60$                                  49.50$                                                      61.60$                                                      

3} GUARD RAIL ENDS ( FULL WRAP ) EQUAL TO BUFFALO
SPECIALTY , NEW HARDWARE ONLY No Bid 38.60$                                                 43.00$                                  44.00$                                                      41.07$                                                      

4} GUARD RAIL ENDS, (FLARED) EQUAL TO BUFFALO
SPECIALTY, NEW HARDWARE ONLY. No Bid 34.20$                                                 43.00$                                  41.75$                                                      32.67$                                                      

5} 1 1/4 " X  5/8 " GUARD RAIL BOLTS No Bid 0.40$                                                   0.95$                                    1.00$                                                        0.61$                                                        

6} 2 " X  5/8 " GUARD RAIL BOLTS No Bid 0.40$                                                   1.05$                                    1.00$                                                        0.71$                                                        

7} 5/8 " GUARD RAIL NUTS No Bid 0.40$                                                   0.10$                                    0.10$                                                        0.65$                                                        

8} 5/8 " GUARD RAIL WASHERS No Bid 0.40$                                                   0.10$                                    1.00$                                                        0.47$                                                        

9} 12' X 2 7/8" O.D. GALVANIZED PIPE, 110 WALL THICKNESS 49.58$                                               39.65$                                                 33.00$                                  48.50$                                                      50.40$                                                      

10} 10 ' RIBBED BACK FLANGED STEEL CHANNEL POSTS,
3/8" DIAMETER HOLES ON 1 " CENTERS, PAINTED 
DARK GREEN, 2 POUNDS PER FOOT. 16.78$                                               12.94$                                                 19.35$                                  24.75$                                                      18.29$                                                      

11} 12 ' RIBBED BACK FLANGED STEEL CHANNEL POSTS  3/8"
DIAMETER , HOLES ON 1 " CENTERS, PAINTED DARK
GREEN, 2 POUNDS PER FOOT. 18.94$                                               15.44$                                                 23.25$                                  28.25$                                                      21.94$                                                      
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12} 10 ' GALVANIZED CHANNEL POSTS,
3/8" DIAMETER HOLES ON 1 " CENTERS  
 2 POUNDS PER FOOT 19.98$                                               16.94$                                                 29.05$                                  28.25$                                                      23.54$                                                      

13} 12 ' GALVANIZED CHANNEL POSTS  3/8"
DIAMETER , HOLES ON 1 " CENTERS
 2 POUNDS PER FOOT 24.07$                                               20.16$                                                 34.58$                                  33.75$                                                      19.78$                                                      

14) Schedule 40 Pipe 2-3/8” x  5’ 31.26$                                               24.20$                                                 12.90$                                  15.75$                                                      22.40$                                                      

15) King Blocks No Bid 10.94$                                                 4.90$                                    11.25$                                                      7.47$                                                        
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