TNH009-2021 Sign Blanks

Big Apple Sign Corp - DBA: Big Apple Visual Group

Garden State Highway Products, Inc.

Lightle Enterprises Of Ohio, LLC

247 West 35th Street

301 Riverside Drive

22 E. Springfield St.

New York, NY 10001

Millville, NJ 08332

Frankfort, OH 45628

(631) 881-2001

(856) 692-7572

(740) 998-5363

Mehul Dhara Sharon L. Green David R. Lightle
mehul@bigapplegroup.com Sharon@gshpinc.com dlightle@lightleenterprises.com
Item Item Description Price Price Price

ALL SIGN BLANKS SHALL BE 5052-H38 ALUMINUM ALLOY, .080 GAUGE WITH ALODINE FINISH AND RADIUS CORNERS. RADIUS CORNERS SHALL BE DET! ) BY THE SIZE OF THE BLANK
1) 6" X 12" -NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $1.50 $2.14 $1.80
2) 6" X 18" -NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $2.25 $3.07 $2.70
3) 6" X 24" -NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $3.00 $4.09 $3.60
4) 8" X 12" -NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $2.00 $2.46 $2.60
5) 8" X 18" -NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $3.00 $3.69 $3.60
6) 8" X 24" -NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $4.00 $4.92 $4.80
7) 8" X 30" -NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $5.00 $6.15 $6.00
8) 8" X 36" -NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $6.00 $7.38 $7.20
9) 8" X 42" -NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $7.00 $8.61 $8.40
10) 9" X 20" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $3.75 $4.52 $4.50
11) 9" X 24" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $4.50 $5.43 $5.40
12) 9" X 30"- NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $5.63 $6.79 $6.75
13) 9" X 36" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $6.75 $8.14 $8.10
14) 9" X 42" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $7.88 $9.50 $9.45
15) 12" X 12" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $3.00 $3.48 $3.60
16) 12" X 22" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS,NO RADIUS $5.50 $8.12 $7.20
17) 12" x 18" - 2 HOLES , TOP & BOTTOM ,WITH WHITE ENGINEER GRADE PRISMATIC S $17.00 $6.83 $7.05
18) 12" X 24" - NO HOLES , FLAT BLANKS $6.00 $6.24 $7.20
19) 12" X 30" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $7.50 $7.80 $9.00
20) 12" X 36" - NO HOLES , FLAT BLANKS $9.00 $9.36 $10.80
21) 12" X 42" -NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $10.50 $10.92 $12.60
22) 12" x 48" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $12.00 $12.48 $14.40
23) 18" x 24" - 2 HOLES, TOP AND BOTTOM, FLAT BLANKS $9.00 $9.36 $14.40
24) 18" X 24" FLAT BLANKS WITH NO HOLES $9.00 $9.36 $14.40
25) 18" x 30" - 2 HOLES, TOP AND BOTTOM, FLAT BLANKS $11.25 $11.70 $13.50
26) 18" x 36" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $13.50 $14.04 $16.20
27) 24" X 24" -4 HOLES SQUARE & DIAMOND $12.00 $12.48 $14.40
28) 24" X 30" - 2 HOLES TOP AND BOTTOM $15.00 $15.60 $18.00
29) 24" X 36" - 2 HOLES TOP AND BOTTOM $18.00 $18.72 $21.60
30) 30" x 30" -4 HOLES SQUARE AND DIAMOND $18.75 $19.51 $22.50
31) 30" x 36" -4 HOLES $22.50 $23.40 $27.00
32) 30" x 42" - $26.25 $27.30 $31.50
33) 36" x 48"- 4 HOLES $36.00 $37.44 $43.20
34) 24" X 24" - OCTAGON , 2 HOLES TOP & BTM $16.00 $11.92 $14.30
35) 30" X 30" - OCTAGON,, 2 HOLES TOP & BTM $25.00 $18.31 $21.98
36) 24" YIELD BLANK 2 HOLES TOP & BTM $16.00 $7.77 $10.80
37) 30" YIELD BLNAK 2 HOLES TOP & BTM $25.00 $11.06 $14.80

PLEASE INCULDE A PRICE FOR .100 GAUGE #38-#53
38) 8" X 20" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $5.55 $5.12 $5.10
39) 8" X 24" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $6.65 $6.14 $5.70
40) 8" X 30"- NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $8.35 $7.67 $7.10
41) 8" X 36" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $10.00 $9.21 $8.50
42) 8" X 42" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $11.66 $10.74 $9.92
43) 8" X 48"- NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $13.35 $12.28 $11.34
44) 9" X 20" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $6.25 $5.37 $5.31
45) 9" X 24" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $7.50 $6.44 $6.40
46) 9" X 30"- NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $9.38 $8.06 $7.97
47) 9" X 36" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $11.25 $9.66 $9.56
48) 9" X 42" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $13.13 $11.27 $11.20
49) 12" X 24" - NO HOLES , FLAT BLANKS $10.00 $7.98 $8.50
50) 12" X 30" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $12.50 $9.97 $10.63
51) 12" X 36" - NO HOLES , FLAT BLANKS $15.00 $11.97 $12.75
52) 12" X 42" -NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $17.50 $13.96 $14.88
53) 12" x 48" - NO HOLES, FLAT BLANKS $20.00 $15.96 $17.00

EXTRUDED
54) IG” X 20" - EXTRUDED ALUMINUM BLANKS No Bid $4.49 $6.40
55) IG” X 24" - EXTRUDED ALUMINUM BLANKS No Bid $5.39 $6.40
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56) 6" X 30" - EXTRUDED ALUMINUM BLANKS No Bid $6.73 $8.00
57) 9" X 20" -EXTRUDED ALUMINUM BLANKS No Bid $6.21 $7.80
58) 9" X 24" -EXTRUDED ALUMINUM BLANKS No Bid $7.46 $7.80
59) 9" X 30" - EXSTRUDED ALUMINUM BLANKS No Bid $9.32 $9.75
60) 9" X 36" - EXSTRUDED ALUMINUM BLANKS No Bid $11.19 $11.70
61) 9" X 42" - EXSTRUDED ALUMINUM BLANKS No Bid $13.05 $13.65
62) 9" X 48" -EXTRUDED ALUMINUM BLANKS No Bid $14.91 $15.60
63) CAPS FOR 3" ROUND POST FOR EXTRUDED No Bid $6.89 $7.35
64) 6" BLADE HOLDER, METRO 808EX No Bid $3.96 $5.68
65) 90 DEGREE CROSS FOR EXTRUDED 6" BLADE HOLDER No Bid $3.96 $4.32
66) 45 DEGREE CROSS FOR EXTRUDED 6" BLADE HOLDER No Bid $10.45 $6.02
67) 4 X 8 SHEETS OF 0.40 WHITE ALUMINUM $65.00 $83.92 No Bid
68) 4 X 8 SHEETS OF 0.40 COLORED ALUMINUM $65.00 $88.79 No Bid
69) 4 X 8 SHEETS OF 0.63 WHITE ALUMINUM $65.00 $135.34 No Bid
70) 4 X 8 SHEETS OF 0.63 COLORED ALUMINUM $65.00 $135.34 No Bid
71) 30 X 30 ALUMINUM SCHOOL CROSSING BLANKS No Bid $18.85 $22.00
72) HEAVY DUTY IMPACT RESISTANT BARRICADE A - FRAME- No Bid $22.60 No Bid

DESIGNED FOR ONE OR TWO | BEAM PANELS, . No Bid No Bid

A - FRAMES ONLY : No Bid No Bid
73) 90 DEGREE FLAT CROSS PC. 12" SLOT No Bid $8.23 $9.68
74) 45 DEGREE UNIVERSAL RPB457F No Bid $3.89 $6.02
75) 45 DEGREE UNIVERSAL RPB457X No Bid $3.89 $6.02
76) 2 3/8" ROUND CAP FLAT 12" No Bid $8.23 $8.90
77) 2X3 ADAPTER CAPS No Bid $7.69 No Bid
78) W800 METRO WING BRACKET (PLAIN FINISH) No Bid $16.56 $13.40
79) 011-GSI-3FC-12 FLAT CAP FOR 3" ROUND POST No Bid $13.92 $11.03
80) 011-GSI-3EX-12" EXTRUDED CAP FOR 3" ROUND POST No Bid $13.92 $10.63
81) 011-GSI-3FC 18" FLAT CAP FOR 3" ROUND POST No Bid $28.93 No Bid
82) 011-GSI-3EX-18" EXTRUDED CAP FOR 3" ROUND POST No Bid $28.93 No Bid
83) 90 FCRS-12" CROSS No Bid $8.23 $9.93
84) 90 FCRS-18" CROSS No Bid $36.00 No Bid
85) 90 EXCRS -12" CROSS No Bid $8.23 $9.93
86) 90 EXCRS -18" CROSS No Bid $36.00 No Bid
87) RH3425SS SS Strapping No Bid $33.20 $38.38
88) RHMODELC1 Strap Cutter No Bid $64.00 $53.40
89) RHMODELP1 Ratchet Type Strapping Tool No Bid $183.32 $112.00
90) RHPLUSASS (100) Per Box No Bid $56.67 / Box of 50 $102.00
91) RHMINUS4SS (100) Per Box No Bid $56.67 / Box of 50 $102.00
92) RHO6SS Wing Seal No Bid $21.40 $33.69
93) RH365SS Buckle No Bid $29.34 $33.69
94) RHSLA Snap Lock Assembly 9/16” x 40” No Bid $5.32 $4.95
95) RH7 Jack Base and Heavy Duty Handle (Puller not included) No Bid $271.42 $475.00
96) RH4A Post Puller No Bid $121.42 $300.00
97) RH4AA Post Puller No Bid $135.71 $300.00
98) RH5165S 5/16” x 18 x3/4” Stainless Steel Bolt No Bid $0.22 $0.44
99) RHDH8 One Man Post Driver 65” 38lbs. No Bid $221.42 $2,395.00
100) RH8SS 5/16” Stainless Steel Nut No Bid $0.20 $0.12

REFLECTIVE ROLL UP SIGNS WITH LETTERING
101) 36 X 36 Roll up sign shall be fabricated using 3M Diamond Grade No Bid $126.40 $122.00

Reflective material only. Construction roll up signs shall have Lexan

Pockets and must use a Duralatch Cross Brace which also must be

included in the price Part # GSI150-36RRS-WCB
102) Stand Only Folded Dimension: 2'2" x 7.50" x 6.50"" Deployed Height: No Bid $114.65 $123.00

6'5" Sign Height: 12" Shipping Weight: 21 LBS.Aircraft aluminum

uprights & steel legs. Rubber caps on legs for extra traction. Steel

base and springs specially coated to withstand 500 hours of salt spray

12" distance of 48" signface from ground, Steel, to be used with a

rollup sign, deployed height 6'5" Part #GSI-150-CAM40
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