Ferguson Waterworks

Campbell Foundry Company

TNHO050-2021

Manhole Castings & Covers

200 Atlantic Avenue

800 Bergen Street

Chemung Supply Corp.

New Hyde Park, NY 11040

Harrison, NJ 07029

PO Box 527

Rick Gambone

Greg Campbell

Elmira, NY 14902

(516) 479-2089

(973) 483-5480

Carl H. Perine

Rick.Gambone@Ferguson.com

Greg@CampbellFoundry.com

(607) 733-5506

Cperine@Chemungsupply.com

PRICE comments PRICE
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$132.00 $115.00
$128.00 $110.00
$120.00 $110.00
$125.00 $115.00
$120.00 $115.00
$115.00 $108.00
$305.00 $450.00
$135.00 2"and13/8" $475.00
$135.00 $275.00
$135.00 $305.00
$135.00 $315.00
$70.00 No Bid

$38.00

$59.40

$179.20

$282.20

Iltem Number Item description PRICE
Risers:
1 Nassau 2" rise poly 24" diameter 2" cover No Bid
2 Nassau 1 1/2" rise poly 24" diameter, 2" cover No Bid
3 Nassau 1" rise poly 24" diameter, 2" cover No Bid
4 Nassau 2" rise poly 24" diameter 1 1/2" cover No Bid
5 Nassau 1 1/2" rise poly 24" diameter, 1 1/2" cover No Bid
6 Nassau 1" rise poly 24" diameter, 1 1/2" cover No Bid
7 38" diameter 1" rise poly 1 1/2 " cover No Bid
8 29" diameter 1" riser poly 1 1/2 " cover No Bid
9 36" diameter 1" rise poly 1 1/2 " cover No Bid
10 Nassau 2" adj metal 24" diameter 2" cover No Bid
11 Nassau 1 1/2" adj metal 24" diameter, 2" cover No Bid
12 Nassau 1"adj metal 24" diameter, 2" cover No Bid
13 Nassau 2" adj metal 24" diameter 1 1/2" cover No Bid
14 Nassau 1 1/2" adj metal 24" diameter, 1 1/2" cover No Bid
15 Nassau 1" adj metal 24" diameter, 1 1/2" cover No Bid
16 24" round Nassau county Heavy duty frame with cover approx. 7”-10” high No Bid
17 24" round Heavy duty slotted cover -please state thickness available No Bid
18 Solid man hole covers 24" dia- 1" thick No Bid
19 Solid man hole covers 24” dia- 1 1/2” thick No Bid
20 Solid man hole covers 24" dia -2" thick No Bid
21 Reed Manufacturing Mh26 26 1/2in Manhole cover hook or equal No Bid
22 6” x 20’ $47.00
23 8” x 20’ $73.80
24 18" x 20’ $222.20
25 24" x 20’ $349.80
26 6” tee $30.27
27 6" 45 degree $20.20

$21.39

$16.81



mailto:Rick.Gambone@Ferguson.com
mailto:Greg@CampbellFoundry.com
mailto:Cperine@Chemungsupply.com

Ferguson Waterworks

Campbell Foundry Company

TNHO050-2021

Manhole Castings & Covers

200 Atlantic Avenue

800 Bergen Street

Chemung Supply Corp.

PO Box 527

New Hyde Park, NY 11040

Harrison, NJ 07029

Rick Gambone

Greg Campbell

Elmira, NY 14902

Carl H. Perine

(516) 479-2089

(973) 483-5480

Rick.Gambone@Ferguson.com

Greg@CampbellFoundry.com

(607) 733-5506

Cperine@Chemungsupply.com

PRICE

comments

No Bid

PRICE

No Bid

$16.81

No Bid

$3.83

No Bid

$31.59

No Bid

$26.49

No Bid

$26.49

No Bid

$5.23

No Bid

$225.01

No Bid

$116.57

No Bid

$141.64

No Bid

$8.96

No Bid

$347.87

No Bid

$238.06

42

1" high x 7 1/2" dia

Iltem Number Item description PRICE
28 6” 90 degree $23.78
29 6” coupler /clamp $5.45
30 8” tee $44.70
31 8” 45 degree $37.45
32 8” 90 degree $37.45
33 8” coupler/clamp $7.40
34 18” tee $318.45
35 18” 45 degree $207.56
36 18” 90 degree $237.95
37 18” couple/clamp $19.07
38 24" tee $492.34
39 24” 45 degree $405.86
40 24” 90 degree $405.86
41 24” coupler/clamp $27.01

No Bid

No Bid

$280.08

43

1 1/2" high x 7 1/2" dia

No Bid

$21.78

No Bid

44

6-0"

2" high x 7 1/2" dia

long - 9" wide 6-1/2" high- approx

No Bid

|46 |19 dia with 14-1/2" cover 8" deep -metal

$140.00

No Bid

No Bid

$205.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$445.00

No Bid

$1,225.00

No Bid

$1,050.00

No Bid

$545.00

No Bid

47 a 2'x 2'x 2' 6" box with top & bottom No Bid
b 24" square grate No Bid
c 48" x 24" approx No Bid
d Parkway grate and frame 49” L X 25.5" W X 5" H No Bid
e Parkway grate and frame 49" L X 30" W X 5" H (Without-Curb Box) No Bid
f Reticuline locking steel grate, Galvanized- approx. 48” x 24” 4 “ thick No Bid
g Reticuline Heavy duty frame & grate —approx 48” x 24” 4” thick frame approx. 54” x 32” No Bid

$1,050.00

No Bid

3131A

No Bid
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PRICE

comments

Cperine@Chemungsupply.com

$615.00

PRICE

$275.00

No Bid

$245.00

No Bid

$285.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Iltem Number Item description PRICE
h Heavy Duty Inlet frame & Bicycle grate- approx. 48” X 26” frame in approx. 54” x 32” No Bid
i 24" x 24’ heavy duty frame with open grate No Bid
j 21 3/4" x 48" approx- Parkway grate No Bid
k 21 3/4" x 48" approx- pigeon hole grate No Bid
I Pigeon Hole Grate 48"L X 16"H No Bid
m Without Pigeon Hole Grate 48"L X 16"H No Bid
n Curb box - metal 6" high 8-3/4" wide 48"long approx No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$235.00

No Bid

No Bid

$290.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2.00/Ib.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

48 overall 26-5/16" x 7-3/8" high approx No Bid
49 8' x 4' storm ring -concrete No Bid
50 8" high dome -concrete No Bid
51 Precast 8’ concrete low dome No Bid
52 All East Jorden iron works municipal and construction castings-catalog - minus discount offe] No Bid
53 Precast-10’ x 4’ storm ring No Bid
54 Precast 10’ concrete storm ring dome —High No Bid
55 Precast 10’ concrete storm ring —low No Bid
56 30" concrete cover No Bid
57 24" concrete collar 1” No Bid
58 24" concrete collar 2” No Bid
59 Concrete drain pipe 18” approx. 6’ length No Bid
60 Concrete drain pipe 24” approx. 6’ length No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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